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A PORTFOLIO OF PUBLIC 
SPACES THAT FEEL 

LIKE HOME.
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Designer Brianne Bishop created playful, 
unexpected, and sophisticated interiors in the 
public spaces of Avra, a luxury rental building.  
The color scheme was a mix of warm and cool with 
some punchy color on banquettes and in seating 
areas. The goal was to create a surprise around 
every corner. In the 20th floor lounge area, Bishop 
created intimate seating areas with eye-level 
lighting. Upholstery fabric by Designtex. Flooring 
and carpet by Shaw Floors. An outdoor terrace 
area is furnished with tables and chairs from Brown 
Jordan. Opposite, top: The team used a large-
scale mural wallpaper by Phillip Jeffries to bring 
interest to the entry’s soaring walls with ultrahigh 
ceilings. Opposite, bottom: A striking yellow-and-
slate-blue banquette is covered in durable fabric 
by Designtex. Flooring by Shaw Floors. All paint 
throughout by Benjamin Moore. Wallcoverings 
throughout by Maharam, Pierre Frey, Wolf-Gordon, 
and Phillip Jeffries.
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